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Background 
The prevalence of sexual assault is a significant issue, which affects one in three women globally. In Colombia, 
statistics indicate that seven women are victims of sexual violence for every man assaulted, primarily occurring at 
home. Research indicates that this sort of violence can have repercussions on physical and sexual health, self-
perception and interpersonal relationships. Colombian researchers assert that women who have been sexually 
assaulted often must prove themselves to be beings of constant and complete innocence. If not, it is expected that 
in the report made, the assault will be downplayed or ignored, leading to blaming the woman. This reinforces the 
idea that positions laws within a patriarchal framework and a society that sees women as commodities. Similarly, 
focusing solely on logics and discourses based on pain, suffering, deficit, and incapacity leads those who have 
experienced assault to construct blame-inducing identities. Thus, if the importance of narratives in identity 
construction is emphasized, sexual assault can affect identity narratives, leading to the construction of impoverished 
stories. For this reason, Narrative Therapy becomes an option for change: it is highlighted as a therapeutic approach 
involving the joint construction of new meanings through conversations. Techniques such as problem externalization 
and therapeutic documents, such as collaborative poems, are used to give new meanings to experiences. In addition, 
the concept of CCD is introduced as an innovative intervention strategy, based on the notion of device as a network 
of relationships, collaborative practices and art, questioning the dominant discourses and exploring new ways of 
inhabiting the world through creativity. 
 
Aims 
To understand the processes of narrative re-signification of identity in women who have experienced sexual assault, 
using Collaborative Creative Dispositifs (CCD) inside a group psychotherapeutic process, in order to favor the 
emergence of alternative narratives. The specific objectives were: (i) to explore the dominant narratives around the 
discomfort related to the experience and meanings surrounding sexual assault; (ii) to construct a group 
psychotherapeutic process among women mediated by CCD, which favors change in the narratives, and (iii) to make 
visible the new versions of women's identities constructed from the principles of sisterhood among participants and 
researchers. 
 
Method & procedures 
A qualitative research-intervention process was conducted with a subjective and hermeneutic approach. Knowledge 
generation occurred through interaction, considering intervention as a condition of research. A reflexive and 
narrative perspective linked to second-order cybernetics was adopted. Convenience sampling was used, which 
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allowed the researchers to select participants through an open call on their social networks and social media. 
Inclusion criteria were women who had experienced prior sexual assault, were of legal age, resided in Bogotá 
(Colombia), and were willing to collaborate with other women. A clinical research-intervention process was 
implemented from a systemic perspective, with reflective conversational encounters as a fundamental strategy. Five 
encounters mediated by CCD were conducted to facilitate dialogue on the experience of sexual assault and identity 
constructions in women. Narrative analysis was employed to explore subjectivities and the power of narratives in 
redefining identity. Transcription and coding of sessions led to the construction of analysis matrices in four 
categories: narrative construction of identity, experience of sexual assault, identity after sexual assault, and CCD. 
 
Results & discussion 
People who have experienced sexual assault may attribute different meanings to their experience, and these 
meanings are not always traumatic. Emphasis is placed on the importance of resilience and the capacity for emotional 
mobilization to confront and transform pain, in addition to the need to process the experience in order to achieve 
resignification. After experiencing sexual assault, participants question and reject the terms "victim" and "survivor". 
They find these adjectives uncomfortable as they evoke pity or weakness, and feel that defining themselves with a 
single word limits their ever-changing identity. They choose not to adhere to these common labels, allowing them to 
narrate their experiences in a broader and more dynamic way. In the therapeutic process with CCD, the presence of 
cross-cutting elements such as group work and sorority were essential to enhance its effect. Sorority proved to be a 
crucial component in deconstructing and transforming oppressive narratives. Groupness, collaboration and support 
among women with similar experiences fostered the polyphony of voices and significant change processes, allowing 
the visualization and recognition of shared injustices, giving value to the experiences narrated.  
 
Conclusion 
Narrative resignification in experiences of sexual abuse is possible under the therapeutic work with CCD, which more 
than an accumulation of techniques to apply, is a novel bet in which the developments of narrative therapies and 
artistic expressions are articulated in a collective context, in order to build spaces that humanize relationships and 
allow the emergence of versions of change. However, these techniques alone are meaningless if they do not start 
from a professional position where therapists and researchers privilege reflexivity, sorority, collaboration and the 
construction of support networks as clinical principles. 
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